eProcur	eme	nt	-	Tender I	Details					
Syste								Date : 18-	-Mar-2	022 11:43 A
त्यमेध जगते										📒 Prir
Basic Details										
Organisation Chain Department of Agricultural Res Research,DoARE,MoA Indian I								Agricultural		
Tender Reference Number		R								
Tender ID	2022_I	DARE_67956	8_1							
Tender Type Open Tender				Form of contract Supply						
Tender Category Goods				No. of Covers				2		
General Technical Evaluation Allowed				ItemWise Technical Evaluation Allowed				No		
Payment Mode Offline				l s Mu BOQ	Ilti Currency All	or	No			
Is Multi Currency Allowed For Fee				Allow	r Two Stage Bid		No			
Payment Instruments				ver Details, No. Of Covers - 2						
Offline S.Nolnstrume				Cover No	Cover	Cover Do		ocument Type		Descriptio
1 Bankers Cheque 2 Demand Draft			1			.pdf			Technical Details	
			1							
				2	Finance		.xls			
				2	Finance		.xls			
Tender Fee Detail	l <u>s, [Tot</u>	al Fee in 3	<u> * - 0.00]</u>		Finance EMD Fee Deta	nils	.xls			
Tender Fee in ₹ 0	l<u>s, [Tot</u> 0.00							EMD through	<u>ו</u>	
Tender Fee in ₹0Fee Payable ToN).00 Nil	al Fee in Fee Payab			MD Fee Deta			BG/ST or EM	<u>ו</u>	Financial B
Tender Fee in ₹0Fee Payable ToNTender FeeN	0.00				MD Fee Deta				<u>ו</u>	Financial B
Tender Fee in ₹0Fee Payable ToNTender FeeNExemption).00 Nil				MD Fee Deta		000	BG/ST or EM Exemption	n 1D	Financial B
Tender Fee in ₹0Fee Payable ToNTender FeeNExemption).00 Nil				MD Fee Deta	₹ 25,0 fixed ICA Unit	000 4 - 5	BG/ST or EM Exemption Allowed	n 1D tage	Financial Bi
Tender Fee in ₹0Fee Payable ToNTender FeeNExemption).00 Nil				MD Fee Deta MD Amount in MD Fee Type	₹ 25,0 fixe	000 4 - 5	BG/ST or EM Exemption Allowed EMD Percent EMD Payable	n 1D tage e At	Financial B Yes NA Hyderaba
Tender Fee in ₹ 0 Fee Payable To N Tender Fee N Exemption Allowed).00 Nil				MD Fee Deta MD Amount in MD Fee Type	₹ 25,0 fixed ICA Unit	000 4 - 5	BG/ST or EM Exemption Allowed EMD Percent	n 1D tage e At	Financial Bi Yes NA Hyderaba
Tender Fee in ₹ 0 Fee Payable To N Tender Fee N Exemption Allowed	NO	Fee Payab			MD Fee Deta MD Amount in MD Fee Type	₹ 25,0 fixed ICA Unit	000 4 - 5	BG/ST or EM Exemption Allowed EMD Percent EMD Payable	n 1D tage e At	Financial B Yes NA Hyderaba
Tender Fee in ₹ 0 Fee Payable To N Tender Fee N Exemption A Allowed N Work /Item(s) Title	Vil No	Fee Payab			MD Fee Deta MD Amount in MD Fee Type	₹ 25,0 fixed ICA Unit	000 4 - 5	BG/ST or EM Exemption Allowed EMD Percent EMD Payable	n 1D tage e At	Financial Bi Yes NA Hyderaba
Tender Fee in ₹ 0 Fee Payable To N Tender Fee N Exemption N Allowed N Work /Item(s) N Title Work Description	Supply of Supply	Fee Payab	ole At N		MD Fee Deta MD Amount in MD Fee Type	₹ 25,0 fixed ICA Unit	000 4 - 5	BG/ST or EM Exemption Allowed EMD Percent EMD Payable	n 1D tage e At	Financial Bi Yes NA Hyderaba
Tender Fee in ₹ 0 Fee Payable To N Tender Fee N Exemption N Allowed N Work /Item(s) N Title N Work Description N Pre Qualification D Details N	Supply of Supply of Please r	Fee Payab	ole At N		MD Fee Deta MD Amount in MD Fee Type	₹ 25,0 fixed ICA Unit	000 4 - 5	BG/ST or EM Exemption Allowed EMD Percent EMD Payable	n 1D tage e At	Financial B Yes NA Hyderaba
Tender Fee in ₹ 0 Fee Payable To N Tender Fee N Exemption A Allowed N Work /Item(s) N Title Work Description Pre Qualification Details Independent External	Supply of Supply	Fee Payab	ole At N		MD Fee Deta MD Amount in MD Fee Type	₹ 25,0 fixed ICA Unit	000 4 - 5	BG/ST or EM Exemption Allowed EMD Percent EMD Payable	n 1D tage e At	Financial Bi Yes NA Hyderaba
Tender Fee in ₹ 0 Fee Payable To N Tender Fee N Exemption N Allowed N Work /Item(s) N Title Nork Description Pre Qualification Details Independent External Monitor/Remarks Show Tender Value	Supply of Supply of Please r	Fee Payab	ole At N		MD Fee Deta MD Amount in MD Fee Type	₹ 25,0 fixed ICA Unit	000 4 - 5	BG/ST or EM Exemption Allowed EMD Percent EMD Payable	n 1D tage e At	Financial B Yes NA Hyderaba
Tender Fee in ₹ 0 Fee Payable To N Tender Fee N Exemption A Allowed N	Supply of Supply of Please r	of RT-PCR of RT-PCR of RT-PCR refer Tender	ole At N		MD Fee Deta	₹ 25,0 fixed ICA Unit	000 3 2 2/Ac	BG/ST or EM Exemption Allowed EMD Percent EMD Payable Click to view	n 1D tage e At	Financial Bi Yes NA Hyderaba

Address Institution Institution Institution Should Allow NDA Tender No Allow Preferential Bidder No Critical Dates Is-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Opening Date 25-Mar-2 Publish Date 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Document Download / Sale End Date 24-Mar-2 Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Bid Submission Start Date 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Tender Documents Institication End Date NA Document Documents Indernotice_1.pdf Technical Details Institication Vil Document Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Image: Certificate S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Start IDDARAU (2000) Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Start S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Start KALETY Start S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Start KALETY Start S.No Bid Opener Login Id									
Address Institution Institution Institution Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential Bidder No Critical Dates Is-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Opening Date 25-Mar-2 Document Download / Sale Start 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Document Download / Sale End Date 24-Mar-2 Carification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA State 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Carification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA State 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Carification Start Date 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Image: State 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Image: State 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Image: State 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Image: State State Description Image: State Image: State Vork Hem S.No Document Name Description Image: State Image: State									
Tender Bidder Critical Dates Is-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Opening Date 25-Mar-2 Document Download / Sale Start 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Document Download / Sale End 24-Mar-2 Date NA Clarification End Date NA Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Bid Submission Start Date 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Tender Documents Is-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Tender Documents Is-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Tender Documents Is-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Vork Item S.No Document Name Description Is 1 Tenderotice_1.pdf Technical Details Is Nor Unments S.No Document Type Document Name Description Is S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate KAUSETTY S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate KAUSETTY S.No Bid Opener Login Id	e ICAR-INdian Institute of Rice Research,Hyderaba								
Publish Date 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Opening Date 25-Mar-2 Document Download / Sale Start 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Document Download / Sale End 24-Mar-2 Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Tender Documents 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Variation Start Date 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Tender Documents 11 Tendernotice_1.pdf Technical Details 1 Vork Item S.No Document Type Document Name Description 1 2 Nor Hitem S.No Document Type Document Name Description 1 2 Socuments S.No Document Type Document Name Description 1 2 Bid Opener List Sinvasa Rao K KALISETYS Financial Bid 1 2 Sind Opener Login I d Bid Opener Name Certificate KALISETYS 2 2									
Publish Date 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Opening Date 25-Mar-2 Document Download / Sale Start 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Document Download / Sale End 24-Mar-2 Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Sid Submission Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Tender Documents 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Vork Item S.No Document Name Description [] [] [] York Item S.No Document Type Document Name Description [] [] [] [] York Item S.No Document Type Document Name Description []									
Document Download / Sale Start 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Document Download / Sale End Date 24-Mar-2 Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Sid Submission Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Fender Documents 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 UT S.No Document Name Description [[1 Tendernotice_1.pdf Technical Details [[[Vork Item S.No Document Type Document Name Description [25-Mar-2022 12:00 PM								
Bid Submission Start Date 18-Mar-2022 12:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 24-Mar-2 Tender Documents IT Description I	24-Mar-2022 12:00 PM								
Tender Documents NT S.No Document Name Description I 1 Tendernotice_1.pdf Technical Details I Vork I tem S.No Document Type Document Name Description I 1 B00 B00_715127.xls Financial Bid I Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Limfao@gmail.com Chaitanya Uddaraju UDDARAUU S. widhan_singh@yahoo.com Vidhan Singh Tapeswar TAPESWAR V GeeMARPTS Details GeM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement e process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Document Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details Yes	NA								
NT S.No Document Name Description I 1 Tendemotice_1.pdf Technical Details I Vork Item S.No Document Type Document Name Description I 1 BOQ BOQ_715127.xls Financial Bid I Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login I d Bid Opener Name Certificate S.No Bid Opener Login I d Bid Opener Name Certificate . iirrfao@gmail.com Srinivasa Rao K KALISETTY S . pmecdrr@gmail.com Chaitanya Uddaraju UDDARAUU G . yidhan_singh@yahoo.com Vidhan Singh Tapeswar TAPESWAR N GeMARPTS Details GeM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement e process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Document Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details Yes	24-Mar-2022 12:00 PM								
VIT S.No Document Name Description I 1 Tendernotice_1.pdf Technical Details I Vork Item S.No Document Type Document Name Description I 1 BOQ BOQ_715127.xls Financial Bid I Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate 1. iirrfao@gmail.com Srinivasa Rao K KALISETTY S 2. pmecdrr@gmail.com Chaitanya Uddaraju UDDARAUU G 3. yidhan_singh@yahoo.com Vidhan Singh Tapeswar TAPESWAR N GeMARPTS Details Reason for non availability of GeMARPTS ID Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Document Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Process allowed Show Fical bid status Yes									
S.No Document Name Description L 1 Tendernotice_1.pdf Technical Details Image: Source of the source									
Work Item Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description I BOQ BOQ_715127.xls Financial Bid Financial Bid I Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate L iirrfao@gmail.com Srinivasa Rao K KALISETTY S 2. pmecdrr@gmail.com Chaitanya Uddaraju UDDARAU G 3. vidhan_singh@yahoo.com Vidhan Singh Tapeswar TAPESWAR N GeMARPTS Details Reason for non availability of GeMARPTS ID Remarks GeM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement e process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Document Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details Yes	Document Size (in KB)								
S.No Document Type Document Name Description I 1 BOQ BOQ_715127.xis Financial Bid Financial Bid Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login I d Bid Opener Name Certificate 1 iirrfao@gmail.com Srinivasa Rao K KALISETTY S 2. pmecdrr@gmail.com Chaitanya Uddaraju UDDARAJU G 3. Vidhan_singh@yahoo.com Vidhan Singh Tapeswar TAPESWAR V GeMARPTS Details Remarks GeM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement e process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Pocument Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering Process allowed No Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details Yes	961.9								
Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login I d Bid Opener Name Certificate . iirrfao@gmail.com Srinivasa Rao K KALISETTY S 2. pmecdrr@gmail.com Chaitanya Uddaraju UDDARAJU C 3. vidhan_singh@yahoo.com Vidhan Singh Tapeswar TAPESWAR N GeMARPTS Details Reason for non availability of GeMARPTS ID GeM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement e process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Urgent nature of Procurement size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details Yes	Document Size (in KB) 283.5								
S.No Bid Opener Login I d Bid Opener Name Certificate I. iirrfao@gmail.com Srinivasa Rao K KALISETTY S 2. pmecdrr@gmail.com Chaitanya Uddaraju UDDARAJU G 3. vidhan_singh@yahoo.com Widhan Singh Tapeswar TAPESWAR N GeMARPTS Details Reason for non availability of GeMARPTS ID Urgent nature of Procurement GeM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement e process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Document Size (in KB) 147.51									
	ertificate Name								
B. Vidhan_singh@yahoo.com Vidhan Singh Tapeswar TAPESWAR V GeMARPTS Details Reason for non availability of GeMARPTS ID Urgent nature of Procurement GeM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement e process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Document Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Finance bid Yes	LISETTY SRINIVASA RAC DARAJU CHAITANYA								
Reason for non availability of GeMARPTS ID Urgent nature of Procurement Remarks GeM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement e process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Document Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Finance bid Yes Show Finance bid Yes	TAPESWAR VIDHAN SINGH								
Reason for non availability of GeMARPTS ID Urgent nature of Procurement Remarks GeM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement e process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Document Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details Yes									
GetMARPTSTD GetMarpTsTD Remarks GetM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement e process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Document Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Process allowed Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details Yes									
Refinance process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment. Document Name PermissionLetter.pdf Document Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering Process allowed No Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details Yes	GeM Bidding did not yield qualified bids and due to urgency in procurement eprocurement								
Document Size (in KB) 147.51 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Process allowed Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details Yes	process is initiated for procuring the essential equipment.								
Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Process allowed Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details Yes	·								
Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes Process allowed Yes Show Bids Details Yes									
Process allowed Show Bids Details									
status									
BoQ Comparative Chart Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 nodel									
BoQ Comparative Chart L Form Based BoQ No Rank Type	No								

Name	Director
Address	ICAR-Indian Institute of Rice Research, Hyderabad
Tender Creator	Details
Created By	Chaitanya Uddaraju
Designation	Senior Technical Officer
Created Date	18-Mar-2022 11:00 AM